
City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division

SEALED BID TABULATION

Date  11/06/2025
Quote Title Tire Repair and Replacement Services
Department of Public Works
Request for Quote ID  RFB-14DPW-1731
Buyer   Kyle Willis

Dismounting old tire, mounting, 
and balancing new tire in shop

Price per Tire
Dismounting old tire, 

mounting, and balancing 
new tire in shop

Price per Tire

Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single Rear 
Wheel

$20.00 
Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$17.00 

Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, Dual 
Rear Wheels

$30.00 
Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, 
Dual Rear Wheels

$27.00 

Medium/Heavy Duty Trucks/Trailers $40.00 
Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$49.00 

Service Run Price Per Run/Mile Service Run Price Per Run/Mile

Service Runs in Marion County $125.00 Service Runs in Marion County $115.00 

Service Runs Outside Marion County 
(In addition to travel costs per run 
charged above)

$1.00 
Service Runs Outside Marion 
County (In addition to travel 
costs per run charged above)

$2.00 

 Repair of Tires (Tubeless)
(Tire and wheel not removed from 

vehicle, plugging of tire only)
Price per Plug

 Repair of Tires (Tubeless)
(Tire and wheel not removed 
from vehicle, plugging of tire 

only)

Price per Plug

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers and 
Mowing Equipment

No Bid
Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

$2.50 

Specialized equipment including but 
not limited to: Wheel Loaders, 
Graders, Back Hoes and Excavators

No Bid

Specialized equipment 
including but not limited to: 
Wheel Loaders, Graders, Back 
Hoes and Excavators

$2.50 

Central Indiana Tire and Retreading Gem City Tire Inc



City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division

SEALED BID TABULATION

 Repair of Tires (Tubeless)
(Includes removal of tire and wheel 
assembly from vehicle, repair with 

a combination patch/plug)

Price per Dismount and Remount

 Repair of Tires (Tubeless)
(Includes removal of tire and 

wheel assembly from 
vehicle, repair with a 

combination patch/plug)

Price per Dismount and Remount

Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single Rear 
Wheel

$25.00 
Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$22.00 

Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, Dual 
Rear Wheels

$35.00 
Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, 
Dual Rear Wheels

$30.00 

Medium/Heavy Duty Trucks/Trailers $55.00 
Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$53.00 

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers and 
Mowing Equipment

$55.00 
Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

$55.00 

Specialized equipment including but 
not limited to: Wheel Loaders, 
Graders, Back Hoes and Excavators

$100.00 

Specialized equipment 
including but not limited to: 
Wheel Loaders, Graders, Back 
Hoes and Excavators

$80.00 

Repair of Tires (Tube Type) Price per Tire Tube Repair of Tires (Tube Type) Price per Tire Tube

Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single Rear 
Wheel

$25.00 
Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$21.00 

Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, Dual 
Rear Wheels

$35.00 
Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, 
Dual Rear Wheels

$30.00 

Medium/Heavy Duty Trucks/Trailers $55.00 
Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$50.00 

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers and 
Mowing Equipment

$65.00 
Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

$50.00 

Specialized equipment including but 
not limited to: Wheel Loaders, 
Graders, Back Hoes and Excavators

$100.00 

Specialized equipment 
including but not limited to: 
Wheel Loaders, Graders, Back 
Hoes and Excavators

$50.00 

Central Indiana Tire and Retreading Gem City Tire Inc



City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division

SEALED BID TABULATION

Switching Tire/Wheel Assemblies 
(Assembly pre mounted by the City 

and Furnished to the Vendor)
Price per Assembly

Switching Tire/Wheel 
Assemblies 

(Assembly pre mounted by 
the City and Furnished to the 

Vendor)

Price per Assembly

Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single Rear 
Wheel

$20.00 
Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$16.00 

Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, Dual 
Rear Wheels

$25.00 
Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, 
Dual Rear Wheels

$20.00 

Medium/Heavy Duty Trucks/Trailers $35.00 
Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$21.00 

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers and 
Mowing Equipment

$50.00 
Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

$32.00 

Specialized equipment including but 
not limited to: Wheel Loaders, 
Graders, Back Hoes and Excavators

$60.00 

Specialized equipment 
including but not limited to: 
Wheel Loaders, Graders, Back 
Hoes and Excavators

$45.00 

Purchase of Emergency Required 
Tubes  

(Various Quantities and Sizes)
Price per Tire Tube

Purchase of Emergency 
Required Tubes  

(Various Quantities and 
Sizes)

Price per Tire Tube

Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single Rear 
Wheel

$20.00 
Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$17.50 

Medium/Heavy Duty Trucks/Trailers $50.00 
Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$55.00 

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers and 
Mowing Equipment

$75.00 
Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

$79.00 

Specialized equipment including but 
not limited to: Wheel Loaders, 
Graders, Back Hoes and Excavators

$100.00 

Specialized equipment 
including but not limited to: 
Wheel Loaders, Graders, Back 
Hoes and Excavators

$105.00 

Central Indiana Tire and Retreading Gem City Tire Inc



City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division

SEALED BID TABULATION

Replacement of Tires Price per Tire Replacement of Tires Price per Tire
Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single Rear 
Wheel

$125.00 
Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$125.00 

Medium/Heavy Duty Trucks/Trailers $145.00 
Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$135.00 

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers and 
Mowing Equipment

$160.00 
Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

$145.00 

Miscellaneous Valve Stems and 
Other Items

Price per Unit
Miscellaneous Valve Stems 

and Other Items
Price

Valve Stems, any size rubber, short 
and long stem
for Car, Van or Pickup

$5.00 
Valve Stems, any size rubber, 
short and long stem
for Car, Van or Pickup

$2.00 

Valve Stems, any size rubber, short 
and long stem
for Medium/Heavy Trucks

$5.00 
Valve Stems, any size rubber, 
short and long stem
for Medium/Heavy Trucks

$5.00 

O-rings, any size required $15.00 O-rings, any size required $13.00 
Valve Stems with built in TPMS 
Sensors – OEM
Ford

$75.00 
Valve Stems with built in TPMS 
Sensors – OEM
Ford

$60.00 

Valve Stems with built in TPMS 
Sensors – OEM
GM

$75.00 
Valve Stems with built in TPMS 
Sensors – OEM
GM

$60.00 

Valve Stems with built in TPMS 
Sensors – OEM
Chrysler

$75.00 
Valve Stems with built in TPMS 
Sensors – OEM
Chrysler

$60.00 

Valve Stems with built in TPMS 
Sensors – OEM
Toyota

$75.00 
Valve Stems with built in TPMS 
Sensors – OEM
Toyota

$60.00 

Fleet Checks Price per Visit Fleet Checks Price per Visit
Daily cost per visit at any one (1) 
location,
including travel costs.

$105.00 
Daily cost per visit at any one 
(1) location,
including travel costs.

$100.00 

Additional Service and Rates Rate Additional Service and Rates Rate

OTR Service Call $200.00 
Specialized Service Call - 
Wheel Loaders/Excavators

$200.00 

Central Indiana Tire and Retreading Gem City Tire Inc



City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division

SEALED BID TABULATION

Percentage Discount off MSRP 
(list price)

52.50%

Listed in (name of) Manufacturer 
Catalog

Police Pursuit

Percentage Discount off MSRP 
(list price)

48%

Listed in (name of) Manufacturer 
Catalog

Passenger - Light Truck

Percentage Discount off MSRP 
(list price)

60%

Listed in (name of) Manufacturer 
Catalog

Medium Light truck - Medium Truck

Percentage Discount off MSRP 
(list price)

75%

Listed in (name of) Manufacturer 
Catalog

Retread

Gem City Tire Inc



City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division

SEALED BID TABULATION

Dismounting old tire, 
mounting, and balancing 

new tire in shop
Price per Tire

Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$17.00 

Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, 
Dual Rear Wheels

$26.00 

Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$48.00 

Service Run Price Per Run/Mile

Service Runs in Marion County $110.00 

Service Runs Outside Marion 
County (In addition to travel 
costs per run charged above)

$2.50 

 Repair of Tires (Tubeless)
(Tire and wheel not removed 

from vehicle, plugging of 
tire only)

Price per Plug

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

No Bid

Specialized equipment 
including but not limited to: 
Wheel Loaders, Graders, Back 
Hoes and Excavators

No Bid

Pomp's Tire Service



City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division

SEALED BID TABULATION

 Repair of Tires (Tubeless)
(Includes removal of tire and 

wheel assembly from 
vehicle, repair with a 

combination patch/plug)

Price per Dismount and Remount

Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$22.00 

Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, 
Dual Rear Wheels

$30.00 

Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$53.00 

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

$53.00 

Specialized equipment 
including but not limited to: 
Wheel Loaders, Graders, Back 
Hoes and Excavators

$79.00 

Repair of Tires (Tube Type) Price per Tire Tube

Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$22.00 

Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, 
Dual Rear Wheels

$30.00 

Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$53.00 

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

$53.00 

Specialized equipment 
including but not limited to: 
Wheel Loaders, Graders, Back 
Hoes and Excavators

$79.00 

Pomp's Tire Service



City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division

SEALED BID TABULATION

Switching Tire/Wheel 
Assemblies 

(Assembly pre mounted by 
the City and Furnished to 

the Vendor)

Price per Assembly

Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$17.00 

Light Duty, One Ton Vehicles, 
Dual Rear Wheels

$20.00 

Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$22.00 

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

$32.00 

Specialized equipment 
including but not limited to: 
Wheel Loaders, Graders, Back 
Hoes and Excavators

$48.00 

Purchase of Emergency 
Required Tubes  

(Various Quantities and 
Sizes)

Price per Tire Tube

Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$17.00 

Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$53.00 

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

$79.00 

Specialized equipment 
including but not limited to: 
Wheel Loaders, Graders, Back 
Hoes and Excavators

$105.00 

Pomp's Tire Service



City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division

SEALED BID TABULATION

Replacement of Tires Price per Tire
Cars, Vans, Pickups – Single 
Rear Wheel

$126.00 

Medium/Heavy Duty 
Trucks/Trailers

$137.00 

Farm Tractors, Prime Movers 
and Mowing Equipment

$158.00 

Miscellaneous Valve Stems 
and Other Items

Price

Valve Stems, any size rubber, 
short and long stem
for Car, Van or Pickup

$2.50 

Valve Stems, any size rubber, 
short and long stem
for Medium/Heavy Trucks

$6.00 

O-rings, any size required $14.00 
Valve Stems with built in 
TPMS Sensors – OEM
Ford

$69.00 

Valve Stems with built in 
TPMS Sensors – OEM
GM

$69.00 

Valve Stems with built in 
TPMS Sensors – OEM
Chrysler

$69.00 

Valve Stems with built in 
TPMS Sensors – OEM
Toyota

$69.00 

Fleet Checks Price per Visit
Daily cost per visit at any one 
(1) location,
including travel costs.

$100.00 

Additional Service and Rates Rate

After Hours Service Call - 2 Hr 
min

$110.00 

Pomp's Tire Service



City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division

SEALED BID TABULATION

Percentage Discount off MSRP 
(list price) 52.50%

Listed in (name of) Manufacturer 
Catalog Goodyear Price Book

Pomp's Tire Service


